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further deficiencies in your performance or conduct could result in administrative discharge 
action.  On 26 May 1992, you were convicted by special court-martial (SPCM) of 53 days of 
UA, and missing ship’s movement through neglect.  You were sentenced to a period of 
confinement, a forfeiture of pay, and a reduction in paygrade.  On 17 July 1992, you received 
NJP for three specifications of assault consummated by a battery, use of provoking speech, drunk 
and disorderly conduct, and two specifications of wrongful use of a controlled substance.  On 
23 July 1992, you were notified of administrative discharge action by reason of misconduct due 
to commission of a serious offense, a pattern of misconduct, and misconduct due to drug abuse.  
After being advised of your procedural rights, you waived your right to have your case heard by 
an administrative discharge board.  On 5 August 1992, you declined a resident rehabilitation 
program due to alcohol/drug dependency prior to your discharge via the Veterans’ 
Administration Hospital, and excepted an expeditious discharge.  On 13 August 1992, your case 
was forwarded to the separation authority with the recommendation that you receive an other 
than honorable discharge.  On 14 September 1992, the separation authority directed that you 
receive an OTH discharge due to misconduct.  On 14 October 1992, you were discharge from the 
Navy with an OTH characterization of service due to a pattern of misconduct. 
  
A qualified mental health professional reviewed your request for correction to your record and 
provided the Board with an AO regarding your assertion that you were suffering from Post-
Traumatic Stress Disorder and a mental health condition during your service.  The AO noted that   
based on the current available evidence, there is some post-service evidence that you may have 
incurred PTSD or another mental health condition during military service, but there is 
insufficient evidence that your misconduct could be attributed to a mental health condition. 
 
The Board carefully considered all potentially mitigating factors to determine whether the 
interests of justice warrant relief in your case in accordance with the Wilkie Memo.  These 
included, but were not limited to your assertions that: (a) while in-service you suffered from 
undiagnosed PTSD and depression; (b) the depression and PTSD began after deploying to the 
Gulf War; (c) you developed problems with alcohol and received counseling; (d) you did not 
receive any counseling or psychological services for your other mental health issues; and (e) you 
believe, along with your professional therapist, that your behavior is directly related to your 
struggles with mental health that came after your service in the Gulf War.  Based upon this 
review, the Board concluded these potentially mitigating factors were insufficient to warrant 
relief.  Specifically, the Board determined that your misconduct, as evidenced by your five NJPs, 
conviction by SPCM, the fact that you were briefed on the Navy’s policy regarding drug and 
alcohol abuse, and warned of the consequences of further misconduct on more than one occasion 
outweighed these mitigating factors.  The Board also concurred with the AO that based on the 
current available evidence, there is some post-service evidence that you may have incurred 
PTSD or another mental health condition during military service, but there is insufficient 
evidence that your misconduct could be attributed to a mental health condition. Accordingly, 
given the totality of the circumstances, the Board determined that your request does not merit 
relief.  
  
 
 
 
 






