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1.  Pursuant to the provisions of reference (a), Subject, hereinafter referred to as Petitioner, filed 
enclosure (1) with the Board for Correction of Naval Records (Board), requesting that his naval 
record be corrected to reflect an upgraded characterization of service.  
 
2.  The Board, consisting of , , and , reviewed Petitioner’s 
allegations of error and injustice on 18 March 2022 and pursuant to its regulations determined 
the corrective action indicated below should be taken.  Documentary material considered by the 
Board consisted of Petitioner’s application together with all material submitted in support 
thereof, relevant portions of Petitioner’s naval record, and applicable statutes, regulations, and 
policies, to include the 3 September 2014 guidance from the Secretary of Defense regarding 
discharge upgrade requests by Veterans claiming post-traumatic stress disorder (PTSD) (Hagel 
Memo), the 25 August 2017 guidance from the Office of the Under Secretary of Defense for 
Personnel and Readiness (Kurta Memo), and the 25 July 2018 guidance from the Under 
Secretary of Defense for Personnel and Readiness regarding equity, injustice, or clemency 
determinations (Wilkie Memo).  Additionally, the Board considered the advisory opinion (AO) 
furnished by a qualified mental health provider, documents submitted in rebuttal, and subsequent 
AO. 
 
3.  The Board, having reviewed all the facts of record pertaining to Petitioner's allegations of 
error and injustice finds as follows: 
 
     a.  Before applying to this Board, Petitioner exhausted all administrative remedies available 
under existing law and regulations within the Department of the Navy.  Although Petitioner did 
not file his application in a timely manner, the statute of limitation was waived in accordance 
with the Kurta Memo. 
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     b.  Petitioner enlisted and entered a period of active duty in the Navy on 28 January 1985.   
      
     c.  In August 1986, Petitioner was injured and suffered burns while on duty. 
   
     d.  Petitioner was convicted by special court martial on 14 July 1988 for wrongful possession 
of LSD in violation of Article 112a, Uniform Code of Military Justice (UCMJ).  He was 
sentenced to confinement at hard labor for 90 days, forfeiture of $440 pay per month for 3 
months, reduction in rank to the pay grade E-1, and discharge from the service with a bad 
conduct discharge (BCD).   
 
     e.  Petitioner requested to be placed on appellate leave on 26 September 1988. 
 
     f.  On 14 December 1989, Petitioner was discharged with a BCD. 
 
     g.  Petitioner contends that he was severely burned by steam when repairing a salinity cell that 
broke due to rust, resulting in second and third degree burns over 61.5% of his body from his 
neckline to his ankles.  He states he believes he developed PTSD and would like to have access 
to benefits.  He states he did not have any prior knowledge of the (drug) charges before or after 
the accident and was incapable of defending himself at the court martial.  He states he did not 
have access to any evidence or the ability to question witnesses.  He contends that since 
discharge, his life has spiraled downward due to his physical and mental conditions and that he 
was never treated for PTSD while in-service. 
 
     h.  In support of this application, Petitioner provided three character references on his behalf, 
civilian psychiatric evaluations, Alcoholics Anonymous attendance documentation, a negative 
criminal records background check, university transcripts indicating he has earned a Master of 
Business degree, and his resume indicating employment since 1991. 
 
     i.  As part of the Board’s review, a qualified mental health provider reviewed Petitioner’s 
assertions and available records and provided an AO dated 28 January 2022.  The AO noted that 
there was no evidence that Petitioner was diagnosed with a mental health disorder during 
military service.  Post-service, clinicians determined a diagnosis of PTSD that is attributed to the 
accident in which he was burned; however, there was insufficient information to establish a 
nexus with his misconduct, as he denied drug use in his statement.  Consequently, the AO 
concluded that there was post-service evidence that the Petitioner may have incurred PTSD 
during military service but insufficient evidence that his misconduct could be attributed to PTSD.  
Petitioner submitted rebuttal evidence to the AO for the Board’s consideration. 
 
CONCLUSION: 
 
The Board reviewed Petitioner’s application under the guidance provided in references (b) 
through (e).  Upon review and consideration of all the evidence of record, the Board concludes 
Petitioner’s request warrants full relief and that his characterization of service should reflect 
Honorable.   
 






