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you were counseled concerning frequent involvement and advised that failure to take corrective 
action could result in administrative separation.  On 6 January 1981, you began a period of UA 
which lasted 48 days.   
 
Based on the information contained on your Certificate of Release or Discharge from Active Duty 
(DD Form 214), it appears that you submitted a voluntary written request for an Other Than 
Honorable (OTH) discharge for separation in lieu of trial (SILT) by court-martial.  In the absence 
of evidence to contrary, it is presumed that prior to submitting this voluntary discharge request, 
you would have conferred with a qualified military lawyer, been advised of your rights, and 
warned of the probable adverse consequences of accepting such a discharge.  As part of this 
discharge request, you would have acknowledged that your characterization of service upon 
discharge would be an OTH. 
 
Unfortunately, the documents pertinent to your administrative separation are not in your official 
military personnel file (OMPF).  Notwithstanding, the Board relies on a presumption of regularity 
to support the official actions of public officers and, in the absence of substantial evidence to the 
contrary, will presume that they have properly discharged their official duties.  Your Certificate 
of Release or Discharge from Active Duty (DD Form 214), reveals that you were separated from 
the Marine Corps on 26 May 1981 with an OTH characterization of service, your narrative reason 
for separation is “to escape trial by court martial” your separation code is “KFS1,” and your 
reenlistment code is “RE-4.”  Your separation code is consistent with a discharge in lieu of trial 
by court martial.        
 
The Board carefully considered all potentially mitigating factors to determine whether the 
interests of justice warrant relief in your case in accordance with the Wilkie Memo.  These 
included, but were not limited to your desire for a discharge upgrade and contentions that: (a) you 
were waiting for a medical discharge and were told you could get a different type of discharge 
that will get you home sooner, (b) you were at the hospital for several years, became homesick, 
and wanted to go home, (c) you were informed that you were going to be convicted by court 
martial for damaging government equipment, specifically breaking your leg, (e) you are seeking 
to apply for Department of Veterans Affairs benefits that you should have been entitled since 
1981, and (f) you were taken advantage because of your age, your suffering and being homesick.  
Additionally, the Board noted you checked the “PTSD” and “Other Mental Health” boxes on your 
application but chose not to respond to the Board’s request for supporting evidence of your 
claims.  For purposes of clemency and equity consideration, the Board noted you did provide six 
character letters of support.  
 
After thorough review, the Board concluded these potentially mitigating factors were insufficient 
to warrant relief.  Specifically, the Board determined that your misconduct, as evidenced by your 
NJPs, SPCM, and SILT discharge, outweighed these mitigating factors.  In making this finding, 
the Board considered the seriousness of your misconduct and the likely negative impact it had on 
the good order and discipline of your unit.  The Board also noted that the misconduct that led to 
your request to be discharged in lieu of trial by court-martial was substantial and, more likely 
than not, would have resulted in a punitive discharge and extensive punishment at a court-
martial.  Therefore, the Board determined that you already received a large measure of clemency 
when the convening authority agreed to administratively separate you in lieu of trial by court-






