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on: Legal, Administrative, and Material Errors. Acting on behalf of the SECAF, HQ AFPC/DPPP 
and HQ AFPC/DPPPO can direct an SSB for an officer if it is determined: The action of the board 
that considered the officer was contrary to law or involved material error of fact or material 
administrative error, or; The board did not consider material information that should have been 
available in compliance with pertinent Air Force directives and policies.; An eligible officer did 
not meet a board or met the board in an incorrect promotion zone or competitive category. 
 
AIR FORCE EVALUATION 
 
AFPC/DPMSPP recommends denying the applicant’s request.  The applicant’s record was pulled 
and reviewed which showed the 2022 and 2023 OPBs were part of the record and considered by 
the CSB.  In addition, the review showed that no enlisted evaluation reports were included.   The 
PRDA record correctly reflects the true picture of the applicant’s  “As-Met” P0423E Board file.   
 
The complete advisory opinion is at Exhibit C. 
 
APPLICANT’S REVIEW OF AIR FORCE EVALUATION 
 
The Board sent a copy of the advisory opinion to the applicant on 24 Jun 24 for comment (Exhibit 
D), and the applicant replied on 22 Jul 24.  In her response, the applicant contended that the PRDAs 
inconsistencies across multiple dates shows the inability of AFPC Officer Promotions Office to 
provide a complete “As-Met” package that is dated 28 Nov 23 and further shows a clear lack of 
traceability of what was reviewed by the CSB.  She trusts the Board will agree that at her OSR 
missing at least some OPBs, along with multiple medal citations, and including her enlisted 
performance reports qualifies as evidence of material error and injustice. 
 
The applicant’s complete response is at Exhibit E. 
 
FINDINGS AND CONCLUSION 
 
1.  The application was timely filed. 
 
2.  The applicant exhausted all available non-judicial relief before applying to the Board. 
 
3.  After reviewing all Exhibits, the Board concludes the applicant is not the victim of an error or 
injustice.  The Board concurs with the rationale and recommendation of AFPC/DPMSPP and finds 
a preponderance of the evidence does not substantiate the applicant’s contentions.  While the 
applicant contends her OSR contained incorrect and missing information, the Board disagrees.  
The Board notes her OSR, dated 20 Nov 23, reflects she has been awarded two Air Medals, three 
Aerial Achievement Medals, and five Air and Space Commendation Medals.  Further, they note it 
reflects her officer assignment history from 2015 to 2023 and contains no enlisted assignment 
history.  Therefore, the Board finds there is no evidence of an error or injustice as her “As-Met” 
package was correct when viewed by the promotion selection board.  The Board understands the 
applicant’s disappointment with the promotion selection board outcome; however, the Board finds 
there is nothing unique to the applicant’s circumstances than that of other similarly situated officers 
who are meeting their promotion board.  Therefore, the Board recommends against correcting the 
applicant’s records.    
 
RECOMMENDATION 
 






