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Dear Petitioner: 

 
This is in reference to your application for correction of your naval record pursuant to Title 10, 
United States Code, Section 1552.  After careful and conscientious consideration of relevant 
portions of your naval record and your application, the Board for Correction of Naval Records 
(Board) found the evidence submitted insufficient to establish the existence of probable material 
error or injustice.  Consequently, your application has been denied. 
 
Although your application was not filed in a timely manner, the Board found it in the interest of 
justice to waive the statute of limitations and consider your case on its merits.  A three-member 
panel of the Board, sitting in executive session, considered your application on 21 July 2025.  
The names and votes of the panel members will be furnished upon request.  Your allegations of 
error and injustice were reviewed in accordance with administrative regulations and procedures 
applicable to the proceedings of this Board.  Documentary material considered by the Board 
consisted of your application together with all material submitted in support thereof, relevant 
portions of your naval record, and applicable statutes, regulations, and policies, to include the 25 
July 2018 guidance from the Under Secretary of Defense for Personnel and Readiness regarding 
equity, injustice, or clemency determinations (Wilkie Memo).   
 
You enlisted in the U.S. Navy and began a period of active duty on 8 November 1968.  Between 
6 June 1969 and 13 October 1970, you received four nonjudicial punishments (NJPs) and were 
convicted by a Summary Court-Martial (SCM)1 for multiple violations that included 
unauthorized absence, disrespect to a petty officer, failure to obey a lawful order, and dereliction 
of duty.  Subsequently, you were referred for a psychiatric evaluation due to your repeated 
disciplinary issues and were diagnosed with an emotionally immature personality disorder.2  
Consequently, you were notified of your pending administrative processing by reason 
unsuitability; at which time you waived your procedural right to submit a statement in response 
to your administrative separation.  Ultimately, the separation authority directed your discharge 
with a type warranted by service record characterization of service and you were discharged with 
a General (Under Honorable Conditions) (GEN) characterization of service on 2 December 
1970.  

 
1 You were found guilty of two specification of UA totaling 23 days and sentenced to reduction in rank to E-2. 
2 The 21 October 1970 Consultation Report stated: "His sensorium was clear and there was nothing from this 

examination to suggest a serious or disabling mental health illness, psychosis or psychoneurosis." [Emphasis added] 






